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again, this really isn't a problem if you're playing on switch as it's totally fine to just ignore all the
bells and whistles, enjoy the whole port, and if you want something a little bit different, download the

director's cut edition, which adds in some extra content, notably more story moments and bonus
content. that's ultimately the crux of the matter here. if you want to play on the go, black flag

remains one of the best titles for switch and the biggest boon that's come along in quite some time.
on the other hand, if you want to sit down to play through all the content and polish the port up a bit,

you can actually do so as well. the fact you have the choice makes this title so incredibly open-
ended, and it'd be fair to say that there are people out there who simply could not care less about

the fine details, to the point they'd rather skip it altogether; having a choice is an absolutely massive
bonus, both literally and figuratively. to make up for some of the shortcomings, our final point of call
is the director's cut edition. this version, which also lets you upload your own custom profile, allows

you to access both the full game and the additional free-roam mode, along with the extra story
content. what black flag excels in more than anything is the level of immersion you experience. it's
incredibly stylish, but at the same time the action is at the very heart of the game. it captures the

true spirit of the open seas. creeps, pirates and naval battles are a huge part of the assassin's creed
experience, and as such if you're looking for a nintendo switch game that truly delivers on the

promise of presenting a believable alternate history, assassin's creed iv: black flag is it. all in all, if
this was the only game in the package the value would be lost, but when you consider the main

game is a console classic you'll be buying a bargain, although i'll admit it is a shame that multiplayer
isn't in here, something we could have done with in rogue too.
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the gameplay in black flag is fantastic. in general, the combat plays perfectly, but there are a few
hiccups. in a few areas, like the jungle, it seems to be very difficult to build up enough speed to
jump, and are unable to build up speed in that area, but it's never too crippling. the ai is pretty

intelligent, which is great. you can tell that each person is a character, and not just a target with a
name. the stealth is also really solid. in general, the stealth is pretty fun, although it can be kind of

frustrating at times, but that's what you get with a game like this. there are some highlights as well.
you can take out guards by diving into them from a distance, for example. the pirates also have a
rouge-like mechanic. killing people can cause you to randomly spawn as another pirate. and even

when you are dead, you can still perform actions like attacking people, etc. speaking of little
touches, you can interact with everything you find in the game. a ship you board can be used to

make weapon or health upgrades, or you can use it to improve your own weaponry or hideouts. you
can even use a ship as a campsite, or even keep it as your home. everything can be interacted with
in this game, and it's very fun. yeah the game is pretty fun, i can honestly say i didnt play the game
in a long time (more than 6 months almost) and i just got back into it and i was pretty pumped by
the combat system. the controls in the beginning they can be a bit clunky, but once you kinda get
used to them, playing the game is a joy to me. the story is good if you like the assassin story, the

colonial times aspect of it is pretty well done. overall this is an awesome game, and the dlc is pretty
good too. to me the main downfall of this is the control pad, it kinda sucks that you have to use the d-

pad or x/y to navigate and when you are zoomed in it just doesnt feel right, but otherwise this is a
very fun game for me. 5ec8ef588b
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